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Establishing and Classifying the Organisation Size of Entities 
Within the Virtual Financial Assets Framework 
 

In view of emerging European Union legislation, such as Regulation (EU) 2022/2554 on 
Digital Operational Resilience for the Financial Sector, the Malta Financial Services Authority 
(‘MFSA’, ‘the Authority’) will start collecting data in relation to the organisation size 
classification of applicants and existing Authorised Persons.  

Entities within the Virtual Financial Assets (‘VFA’) Framework will be required to establish 
and classify their organization size as one of the following: 

1. Microenterprise; 

2. Small Enterprise; 

3. Medium-sized Enterprise; 

4. Non-SME. 

In establishing their organisation size, applicants and existing Authorised Persons are to be 
guided by Commission Recommendation 2003/361/EC of 6 May 2023 and additional 
material released by the European Commission, namely the User Guide to the SME 
Definition and the SME Self-Assessment Questionnaire. 

 

The Process   

Entities within the VFA Framework are required to classify their organisation size in their 
Corporate Profile on the Licence Holder Portal, by selecting the correct classification within 
the SME field.  Entities within the VFA Framework are additionally required to fill and upload 
a self-declaration form, available here, beneath the SME field. The classification selected 
within the SME field and the classification submitted within the self-declaration form must 
match. 

Entities within the VFA Framework are to ensure that the information is kept up-to-date 
within their Corporate Profile. By approving the request to change data within the Corporate 
Profile, the Authority is not validating or approving the information provided by Authorised 
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https://www.mfsa.mt/wp-content/uploads/2023/01/Regulation-EU-20222554-and-Amending-Directive-EU-20222556-on-Digital-Operational-Resilience-for-the-Financial-Sector-published-on-the-EU-Official-Journal.pdf
https://www.mfsa.mt/wp-content/uploads/2023/01/Regulation-EU-20222554-and-Amending-Directive-EU-20222556-on-Digital-Operational-Resilience-for-the-Financial-Sector-published-on-the-EU-Official-Journal.pdf
https://op.europa.eu/en/publication-detail/-/publication/756d9260-ee54-11ea-991b-01aa75ed71a1
https://op.europa.eu/en/publication-detail/-/publication/756d9260-ee54-11ea-991b-01aa75ed71a1
https://ec.europa.eu/growth/tools-databases/SME-Wizard/smeq.do;SME_SESSION_ID=s9jZj2DXvZc918nxRY6cfggRHiF7e4vZxBWL-z7DMYsTu9dKzrSc!1985664871?execution=e1s1
https://www.mfsa.mt/wp-content/uploads/2024/01/AX40-Decleration-of-SMEs.docx?ver=10000
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Persons. However, the Authority reserves the right to check the correctness of the 
information provided at any point in time.  

This change will also impact prospective applicants who will be required to classify their 
organisation size as part of the authorisation process. The Authority will update the relevant 
authorisation material to include the self-declaration form in due course.  

 

Way Forward and Contact  

Entities within the VFA Framework are required to update their Corporate Profile within 
the Licence Holder Portal by no later than 30 April 2024. Entities within the VFA Framework 
may request further information by sending an email to FinTech Supervision within the 
Authority on sufintech@mfsa.mt.  
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